[image: image1.png]...h'* ..'
0 oqut®




ATCHAFALAYA BASIN LEVEE DISTRICT
P. O. Box 170

Port Allen, Louisiana 70767-0170

Phone (225) 387-2249

Fax    (225) 387-4742







June 3, 2020





A Regular Board Meeting of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District was held via teleconference at 4:00 pm, Wednesday, June 3, 2020.  President John Grezaffi called the meeting to order and declared a quorum present.  The following members were present:

COMMISSIONER


PARISH

Kenneth Gordon


West Baton Rouge

John Grezaffi


Pointe Coupee

Mark Guillory


St. Landry

Spencer Harvey


Ascension

Daniel Hebert


Iberville

Karen Jewell



Iberville



Moise LeBlanc


St. Martin

Harry Marionneaux 

Iberville

Earl Matherne


Assumption

Absent: 

Bill Flynn



West Baton Rouge

Jody Meche



St. Martin

Sean McGee



Iberia

Nickie Rockforte


Pointe Coupee

Also Present:

INDIVIDUAL


REPRESENTING

Rick Dugas
 


CPRA
Nicholas Rockforte


Levee Board Attorney

William Tyson


Executive Director
Janice Jarreau


Administrative Program Manager
Kristy Jewell


Human Resource Analyst

Crissi Canezaro


Administrative Program Specialist
Tiffany Weber


Administrative Program Specialist

                                                                    * * * * 
President John Grezaffi asked for public comments.  Hearing none, he proceeded with the agenda.  

                                                                    * * * * 
Mr. Will Tyson asked the board to add an item to the agenda.  He received a Right of Entry

Request to work on a relief well to pump water back in Iberville Parish by the Corps of

Engineers.  Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne

to add the item to the agenda.  The following roll call vote was held:

Yeas:  Commissioners Kenneth Gordon, John Grezaffi, Mark Guillory, Spencer Harvey, Daniel
           Hebert, Karen Jewell, Moise LeBlanc, Harry Marionneaux, and Earl Matherne

Nays:  None

Absent and not voting:  Commissioners Bill Flynn, Sean McGee, Jody Meche, and

                                       Nickie Rockforte

The motion passed.

Commissioner Mark Guillory moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to approve the minutes of May 6, 2020 as presented and to publish the minutes in the official journal.  
                                                                    * * * * 
Mr. Will Tyson advised the board that he received a request for a Right of Entry to work on a relief well to pump water back in Iberville Parish by the Corps of Engineers.  Commissioner Karen Jewell moved to approve the request for the right of entry, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne and unanimously carried.  

Mr. Tyson advised the commissioners the river is rising again.  President Grezaffi asked the Commissioners to contact either him or Mr. Tyson with any needs in their parish so it can be addressed.  

                                                                    * * * *
Mr. Rick Dugas was at the meeting to represent CPRA.  He said as we prepare for hurricane season to let him know if the district needs anything.  Mr. Tyson said he thinks we have plenty of sandbags filled at this time.

                                                                    * * * * 
                                                                 NOTICE

Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners, Atchafalaya Basin 

Levee District, in its Office in Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June 3, 2020 

and can also be submitted online at www.centralauctionhouse.com for:

(1)

Furnishing Gasoline and Diesel Fuel delivered at designated locations

within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months

beginning July 1, 2020 and ending June 30, 2021.

(2)

Furnishing Crushed Limestone delivered at designated locations within the District in quantities as requested for twelve calendar months beginning July 1, 2020 and ending June 30, 2021.

All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid

received after 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.

The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.

Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked





 “BID – FUEL” or “BID - AGGREGATES.”
Specifications, proposal forms, etc., are available at the Atchafalaya Basin Levee 

District Office, (525 Court Street) P. O. Box 170, Port Allen, Louisiana 70767, telephone

number (225) 387-2249.

Janice G. Jarreau





John Grezaffi

Secretary






            President
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Daily Journal of Commerce, The Advocate, Plaquemine Post South, and Pointe Coupee Banner

May 7, 14, and 21, 2020

The following bids were duly opened and read:

	Unleaded Fuel
	Morel Lemoine
	Retif Oil 
	Richard’s

Oil
	Gaubert’s Oil
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 1 Ravenswood
	.129
	.25
	.1289
	.15
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 2

Ravenswood
	.129
	.25
	.1289
	.15
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 3 

Maringouin
	.129
	.25
	.1289
	.17
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 4

Henderson
	.16
	.25
	.2499
	.13
	
	


	Road Use Diesel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount
	Amount

	Unit 5 

Stephensville
	.49
	.25
	.2499
	.13
	
	


Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Mark Guillory, and unanimously carried to award the contract to the low bid in each category after review by the Attorney and Executive Director.  

The following bids were duly opened and read:

	Name of Bidder
	Slat’s Lucas
	Moreau’s Material Yard
	R.J. Thibodeaux
	Acadiana Shell
	Trucking Innovations
	Bear Industries
	  Luhr Bros.

	
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton
	Amount per ton

	ITEM #1

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	34.00
	No Bid
	33.90
	No Bid
	36.00
	40.00

	ITEM #2

Crushed Limestone(#610)
	No Bid
	33.00
	No Bid
	32.90
	No Bid
	35.00
	38.50

	ITEM #3

Crushed Limestone(#57)
	26.50
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	ITEM #4

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	26.35
	28.00
	26.60

	ITEM #5

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	No Bid
	37.50


	39.40
	45.60
	No Bid
	44.50

	ITEM #6

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	No Bid
	39.50
	49.60
	51.00
	No Bid
	46.00

	ITEM #7

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	33.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	48.60
	No Bid
	44.50

	ITEM #8

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	42.40
	42.85
	No Bid
	44.50

	ITEM #9

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	38.25
	No Bid
	39.80
	41.61
	No Bid
	44.50

	ITEM #10

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	35.40
	No Bid
	No Bid
	46.59
	No Bid
	42.50



	ITEM #11

Crushed Limestone (#57)
	38.25
	No Bid
	40.00
	41.40
	49.48
	No Bid
	44.50

	ITEM # 12

Crushed 

Limestone (#57)
	No Bid
	42.00
	40.00
	41.00
	45.60
	No Bid
	44.50

	ITEM #13

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	25.50
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	ITEM #14

Crushed 

Limestone (#610)
	No Bid
	No Bid 
	No Bid
	No Bid
	24.35
	27.00


	23.20


Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Moise LeBlanc, and unanimously carried to take the bids under advisement.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

OFFICIAL JOURNAL


Sealed bids will be received by the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District, at 525 Court Street, Port Allen, Louisiana, up to 2:00 p.m., Wednesday, June  3, 2020, for printing and publication of minutes of meetings of the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District and all other legal advertisements required by law for a period of one (1) year.  


All bids will be publicly opened and read at 4:00 p.m. of the same day, and any bid received subsequent to 2:00 p.m. will be returned unopened.


The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to waive informalities.


Bid to be submitted in sealed envelope marked “BID - OFFICIAL JOURNAL.”

Janice G. Jarreau




 John Grezaffi

Secretary





 President
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Pointe Coupee Banner, Plaquemine Post South and West Side Journal

May 7, 14, and 21, 2020.

The following bid was duly opened and read:

Pointe Coupee Banner - $5.00 per square inch.

Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to take the bid under advisement.  
                                                                    * * * *
Commissioner Earl Matherne moved, seconded by Commissioner Kenneth Gordon, and unanimously carried to authorize the staff to receive quotes for employee uniforms.

                                                                    * * * *
Commissioner Daniel Hebert moved, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried to adopt the amended 2019-2020 Budget as presented.

                                                                    * * * *
Commissioner Daniel Hebert moved, seconded by Commissioner Moise LeBlanc, and unanimously carried to approve the 2020-2021 Budget as presented.  

                                                                    * * * *
Commissioner Karen Jewell moved, seconded by Commissioner Moise LeBlanc to adopt the following sympathy resolution:

 SEQ CHAPTER \h \r 1
RESOLUTION 

Moved by Commissioner Karen Jewell, seconded by Commissioner Earl Matherne, and unanimously carried:

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District learned

with deepest regret and sincere sorrow of the death of Wayne Orillion on May 2, 2020,

and

WHEREAS, Mr. Orillion was an active and respected member of the Board of 

Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin Levee District from May 28, 1992 until 

May 19, 2004, and

WHEREAS, Mr. Orillion will be missed by many who were close to him and who cherished

his friendship.

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the members of this Board do hereby express its

condolences to the family of Mr. Orillion, and its deepest regrets upon his death, that this Resolution be incorporated and made a permanent part of the Minutes of this Board, and

further that a copy of this Resolution be presented to the Orillion Family, so that they may

know of our sincere appreciation of the life of Mr. Orillion and of our sincere regrets in

his passing:

Vote:


Yeas:    Commissioners Kenneth Gordon, John Grezaffi, Mark Guillory, Spencer Harvey,


 Daniel Hebert, Karen Jewell, Moise LeBlanc, Harry Marionneaux, and Earl Matherne

Nays:
None


Absent and not voting:   Commissioners Bill Flynn, Sean McGee, Jody Meche, and

                                        Nickie Rockforte 

The vote in favor thereof being unanimous, the resolution was declared duly adopted.

I, Janice G. Jarreau, Secretary for the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin

Levee District, do hereby certify that the above and foregoing is a true and correct copy

of excerpts of the Minutes of the Board of Commissioners for the Atchafalaya Basin

Levee District, a Regular Meeting held in Port Allen, Louisiana, on Wednesday, June 3,

2020.






 /s/Janice G. Jarreau, Secretary

A roll call vote was called:
Yeas:
Commissioners Gordon, Grezaffi, Guillory, Harvey, Hebert, Jewell, LeBlanc, 


Marionneaux, and Matherne

Nays:
None

Absent and not voting:  Commissioners Flynn, Meche, McGee and Rockforte

The resolution passed unanimously.

                                                                    * * * *
Mr. Nicholas Rockforte, Levee Board Attorney said he is waiting to see what the courts say on the constitutionality question relative to the bike paths before we go forward.  
                                                                    * * * *
There being no further business to come before the board, upon motion by Commissioner Harry Marionneaux, and unanimously carried, the meeting adjourned.
____________________________________           ____________________________________

Janice Jarreau, Secretary


           John Grezaffi, President

____________________________________

Linda Alwood, Contract Stenographer 
An Equal Opportunity Employer

